Kimberly Ross-Collier <mnacllr@gmail.com> Dec12,2023 926AM ¢ (@ & H
to Jessica =

Please read this email in it's entirety because this shows the original prosecutor my original attorney and the states agreement on amount to be paid | cannot access ADP to get
the check stubs showing the amount and my ex employer won't cooperate and give it to me saying they can't give me that information

=mmmmmmee- FOrwarded message ---------

From: Kimberly Ross-Collier <mngglir@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 12:47 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: Kimberly Ross 16-934

To: <sperry@co.hinds.ms.us>

Here is the email from the original agreement | will send you the paperwork as well but at least this is a starting point of verification..
Respectfully,

Kimberly Ross
7693664414



